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The Collier County Sheriff’s Office

is pleased to announce

AMSAN
BOB BARKER
CLEAN AIR & ALLIED SUPPLY
COOK’S CORRECTIONAL
XPEDX

have been awarded various items in the contract for

ITB# 11-004

JAIL SUPPLIES




#11-004 JAIL SUPPLIES
AWARD
BID PRICE

DATE: September 12, 2011
INPUT by: Melissa Pearson, CCSO Sr. Buyer
Jennifer Espinosa, CCSO Buyer Il

Note: Washcloth, White, 12"x12", 100% Cotton Terry - ICS $2.11 & Bob Barker $2.40 - the award was given to Bob Barker due to the only item ICS would have been awarded.

SOW=SCOPE OF WORK/GA=GREEN ALTERNATIVE/EX=EXCEPTION BIDDERS
CLEAN
PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTION uom SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES
BATHROOM SUPPLIES
SOW|]Baby Wipes, Lightly Scented CASE 80CT/12CS NO BID NO BID $38.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAJAMSAN: HOSO2480UN PRECIOUS 12/80CT/CS CASE 12/80CT/CS $38.75
80/TUB 12/CS
SOW]Plunger, Sink/Toilet EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $7.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: TOILET EACH EACH $7.95
EXJAMSAN: IMP 9200 INDUSTRIAL PLUNGER EACH EACH $6.30
SOW]Shower Curtain, Vinyl, Mildew Resistant, 6 Gauge EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAJCLEAN AIR: 6X6 WHT EACH EACH $9.28
GAJAMSAN: AIM-1001 6X6 10 GAUGE EACH EACH $9.30
EXJCLEAN AIR: 3X6 WHT EACH EACH $6.98
soWJRubbermaid® Toilet 6311 Bowl Brush Holder For 6310 Brush EACH EACH $1.70 NO BID $3.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.80
sow]Rubbermaid® 6310 Toilet Bowl Brush (AWARDED=AMSAN & XPEDX) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $3.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENOWN REN 03951 EACH EACH $2.10
SOW, EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $13.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: B221 STAINLESS STEEL EACH EACH $38.48
SOW]Toilet Seat Covers, Half fold - Recycled CASE 250CT/20CS NO BID NO BID $73.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAJAMSAN: RENO3801 $28.00
EXJXPEDX: TOILET SEAT COVERS, HALF FOLD 5K/CTN (2255555) CASE 5K/CTN $36.00
SOW |Toilet Tissue, Single Roll, 2-Ply, 500 Sheets/Roll CASE 500ST/96CS $33.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.00
GAJCLEAN AIR: TOILET TISSUE, SINGLE ROLL, 2-PLY, 500 SHEETS/ROLL (248 GREEN) $34.85
SOW]Tissue, Kleenex, 2-Ply, Single-Fold, 250 Sheets CASE 250ST/72CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAJAMSAN: APP 12507 100SHEET/BOX 30 PER/CS CASE 100ST/30CS $24.40
EXJCLEAN AIR: TISSUE, KLEENEX, 2-PLY, SINGLE-FOLD, 250 SHEETS CASE 250ST/36CS $47.30
EXJXPEDX: RELIABLE FACIAL TISSUE 100/BOX 30 BOX/CTN (3K/CASE) 4441950 100ST/30CS $22.00
SOW]Urinal Tablets - Fresh Cherry BOX 12/BOX NO BID $9.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.50
GAJAMSAN: 4 OUNCE CHERRY $6.90 NO BID
SOW]JWall-Mount Receptacle, Sanitary Napkin Disposal,
7-3/4w X 4-1/2d X 11h, WHITE EACH EACH NO BID $26.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.00
EXJAMSAN: APP18107 $5.60
Sow|]Water Soluble Bags, 18" x 28" x 38" CASE 100/CS NO BID NO BID $118.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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CLEAN

PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTiION Uuom SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES
BEDDING
SOW|]Blanket, Polyester, 72" x 90", Beige (5.60 EACH) - AWARD DUE TO SIZE BALE 20/BALE NO BID $112.00 NO BID NO BID $159.00 NO BID
EX]ICS: BLANKET POLYESTER 62" X 90" ($5.45 EACH x 20 = $109.00) EACH EACH $5.45
SOW]Blanket, Wool, 66" x 90", Gray (50% Wool, 50% Manmade Fibers) (6.70) BALE 20/BALE NO BID $134.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $198.00 NO BID
EXJICS: BLANKET, WOOL, 62" x 90", GRAY (52% WOOL, 48% MANMADE FIBERS) EACH EACH $7.30
(20 x $7.30 = $146.00)
SOW}Mattress, Polyester Core, 30" x 75" x 4", Vinyl, Flame
retardant EACH EACH NO BID $29.90 NO BID NO BID $41.00 $40.00 NO BID
SOW]Pillow, Polyester/Vinyl, Green, 18 oz. CASE 15DZ/CS NO BID $975.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX]|BOB BARKER: PACKAGED 4 PILLOWS PER CASE, $21.68 PER CASE CASE 15Dz/CS
EXJROBINSON TEXTILES: PER DOZEN, 5.90 EACH / $70.80 PER DOZEN CASE 15DZ/CS $1,062.00
EXJICS: PILLOW, POLYESTER/VINYL, GREEN 18 OZ. DOZEN DOZEN $70.80
SOW]Pillow case, Standard, White, 42" x 34" CASE 15DZ/CS NO BID $147.60 NO BID NO BID $180.00 NO BID
EXJSOLD BY DOZEN, $9.84 PER DOZEN CASE 15DZ/CS
EXJICS: PILLOW CASE, STANDARD, WHITE, 42" X 34" DOZEN DOZEN $15.40
SOW|Sheet, 36" x 80" x 6" Medline Soft-Fit Knitted Contour (BOB BARKER: T-130) DOZEN DOZEN NO BID $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Sheet, 54" x 90", flat, bleached, Poly/Cotton, White CASE 5DZ/CASE NO BID $153.00 NO BID NO BID $155.00 NO BID
EX]BOB BARKER: SOLD BY DOZEN, $30.60 PER DOZEN
EXJICS: SHEET, 54" X 90" FLAT BLEACHED POLY/COTTON WHITE DOZEN DOZEN $38.50
SOW]Shower Safety Mat, 14" x 22.5", White EACH EACH NO BID $3.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CLEANING EQUIPMENT
sow]Bottle, Plastic, 32 oz. EACH EACH $0.70 NO BID $0.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.95
SOW]Broom, Black Coarse Angle w/Handle EACH EACH NO BID $9.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENO3944 $9.25
SOW EACH EACH NO BID $10.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENO3998 $9.10
SOW|]Broom, Fine Sweep, 18" EACH EACH NO BID $10.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENO3978 $8.50
SOW|]Broom, Hard Bristle, 18" EACH EACH NO BID $11.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENO3946 $11.60
SOW]Bucket, Rubbermaid, Standard, 14 qgt. EACH EACH NO BID $13.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.00
EXJAMSAN: IMP5514 $9.65
SOW|]Deck Brush, Screw-in, Scrub for 3-6 ft Handles EACH EACH NO BID $7.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENO3953 10" DUAL SURFACE $9.65
SOW]Dust Pan, Plastic, 12" x 8%" EACH EACH NO BID $4.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.50
EXJAMSAN: APP18110 12" PLASTIC $1.69
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CLEAN

PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTION UoMm SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES

SOW]Dusting Tool, 51" Overhead EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $27.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.00

EXJAMSAN: RENO5258 33"- 60" Lambswool EACH EACH $7.50
SOW]Dusting Tool, 102" Overhead EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $35.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.00

EXJAMSAN: RENO3985 52" - 84" Polywool EACH EACH $6.30

EACH EACH $4.38 NO BID $4.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID -
EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $4.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAN: RENO3985 EACH EACH $4.42

EXJCLEAN AIR: WOOD THREAD EACH $4.25
SOWJ]Handle, Antimicrobial Wet Mop, Clamp, Wood, 60" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAM: RENO2604 1 X60 JAWS EACH EACH $11.25

EXJCLEAN AIR: RCPH216 ANTIMICROBIAL CANNOT BE ON A WOOD HANDLE EACH EACH $11.55
SOwWJ]Handle, Plastic, Long, White (CLEAN AIR & ALLIED SUPPLY: 620L) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $6.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sOowW|]Handle, Plastic, Short, White (CLEAN AIR & ALLIED SUPPLY: 620S) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $5.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sow|]Handle, Snap-On Dust Mop, 36" EACH EACH $6.60 NO BID $15.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.00
sow]Handle, Wood Thread Broom, 60" EACH EACH $3.75 NO BID $4.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.00
sow|]Handle, Wood, 60" for Scrub Brushes EACH EACH $3.75 NO BID $4.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.00
SOW]Mop Head, Cotton, 32 oz. CASE 12/CS $68.40 NO BID $39.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.50
SOW]Mop Head, Dust, 5" x 36", Slip On EACH EACH $12.00 NO BID $15.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.00
SOW,| EACH EACH $0.96 NO BID $1.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Squeegee, Complete Floor 22" EACH EACH $12.30 NO BID $21.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJXPEDX: ODELL 24" GRY HIGH IMPACT FOAM RUBBER SQUEEGEE EACH EACH $32.50
SOW]Wringer, Rubbermaid, Brown w/Bucket EACH EACH $110.25 NO BID $79.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJCLEAN AIR & ALLIED SUPPLY: RCP 7580-88BRO

EXJXPEDX: WRINGER RUBBERMAID BROWN W/BUCKET 35QT (BROWN ONLY IN 35QT) $102.00
SOW]Wringer, Rubbermaid, Yellow w/Bucket EACH EACH $75.75 NO BID $79.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $88.00
SOW,| EACH EACH $187.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID -
SOW,| EACH EACH $182.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJCLEAN AIR: RCP6127-88 EACH $79.50
SOW]Green Cleaning Pads EACH EACH $0.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJCLEAN AIR: 96D GREEN CLEANING PADS 10/PK 10/PK $5.45
SOW]55 Gallon Plastic Drum Pump EACH EACH $14.85 NO BID $19.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Floor Stripper Non-Butyl, 1 gallon PACK 4/PK $56.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM FLOOR STRIPPER NON-BUTYL, 1 GALLON PACK 4/PK $13.00

EXJXPEDX: BETCO 1GAL AX-IT PLUS NO RINSE NON-AMMONIATED FLOOR STRIPP CASE 4/Cs $53.00
SOW]Shineline Emulsifier Floor Stripper EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAM: SHINELINE EMULSIFIER FLOOR STRIPER, 5 GAL (10.152 PER GALLON) GAL 5 GAL $50.76

EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM SUPER STRIPPER,$13.00 PER GALLON GAL GAL $13.00

EXJXPEDX: BETCO 1GAL AX-IT PLUS NO RINSE NON-AMMONIATED FLOOR STRIPP(13.25 GAL) CASE 4/cs $53.00
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PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTiION uom SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS
SOW] 3M Hi Pro Stripping Pad PACK 5/PK $74.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]13" Black Stripping Pad PACK 5/PK $21.00 NO BID $15.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX PACK 5/PK
SOW]20" Black Stripping Pad PACK 5/PK $23.15 NO BID $21.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX PACK 5/PK
SOW]13" White Polishing Pad PACK 5/PK $11.80 NO BID $15.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX PACK 5/PK
SOWJ]20" Tan Burnishing Pad PACK 5/PK $25.40 NO BID $21.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX PACK 5/PK
SOW]Ultra Durable Floor Finish CASE 2/CS $78.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM ABILITY 22 4/Cs $75.00
EX CASE 4/Cs
SOW]3M Easy Shine Applicator Pad PACK 2/PK $26.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX CASE 10/CTN
SOW]Intercept Micro Filter PACK 10/PK $15.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Micro Cloth Filter - Coach Vac EACH EACH $30.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Dome Filter EACH EACH $1.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Supercoach BackPACK Vac w/101336 EACH EACH $358.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJProlux 60” Wand w/Aluminum Collar & Sleeve EACH EACH $81.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]20 Plus Floor Finish CASE 4/Cs $72.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM ABILITY 22 4/Cs $75.00
SOW|]Bounce Back Floor Restorer CASE 4/CS $62.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM SUPER SHINE, 1 GALLON CASE 4/Cs $49.00
EXJXPEDX: BETCO 1GAL EXPRESS 1 STEP HIGH SPEED CLEANER RESTORER CASE 4/CS $65.00
SOW]|Chlorine Test Paper PACK 100/PK $1.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]3-Prong Hubbell Plug Male 15A-125V Nylon EACH EACH $7.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Universal Drum Wrench EACH EACH $18.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CLEANING PRODUCTS
Ability 22, High Gloss Floor Wax, 1 Gallon EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $18.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
AMSAN: RENO2910-MS SUPERFINISH Il (4 GAL PER CASE) EACH EACH $16.50
CASE 4/Cs
Bleach, 1 gallon CASE 6/CS $13.90 NO BID $11.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 6/CS
SOW]BIlue Thunder, 30 gallon EACH EACH $182.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Bleach/Hypochorite, 15 gallon EACH EACH $77.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Bleach/Hypochorite, 55 gallon EACH EACH $201.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]|Clear View Glass Cleaner, 1 Gallon EACH EACH $5.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM, 1 GAL EACH EACH $7.05
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PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTION UoMm SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES
EX CASE 4/Cs
SOW]|Clorox Disinfecting Wipes (75CT) (.061 PER SHT) PACK 4/PK NO BID NO BID $18.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
AMSAN: CLOROX DISNFECTIN WIPES 6PK/75CT/CS (.075 PER SHT) CASE 6/CS $34.10
EXJXPEDX: CLOROX DISINFECTING WIPES 75CT TUB 6/CTN 450/CASE ( .077 PER SHT) TUB 6/CASE $35.00
SOW, CASE 9/Cs $40.10 NO BID $41.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]De-Scale Concentrate, 1 Gallon EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $10.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: SPARCLEAN DELIMER, 1 GAL EACH EACH $13.05
SOW|]Disinfecting Wipes, Fresh Scent, Hard Surface (AWARDED = AMSAN & CLEAN AIR) PACK 4/PK NO BID NO BID $18.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR & ALLIED SUPPLY 4PK/75CT/CS (.061 PER SHT) PACK 4/PK
EXJAMSAN: SPARTAN SPA1086 12PK/125CT/CS (.061 PER SHT) CASE 12PK/CS $91.56
SOW|]Dust Mop Treatment Oil, 1 Gallon EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: BRIGHT SHEEN, 1 Gallon EACH EACH $15.95
SOW|[Dynamo Laundry Detergent, 5 Gallon EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $89.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJFoaming Detergent Wax EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: WET WAX-O-WASH 40, 1 Gallon EACH EACH $14.45
SOW|]Mighty Green, 1 Gallon CASE 4/Cs NO BID NO BID $47.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|[Mint-0O Disinfectant Cleaner, 1 Gallon EACH EACH $7.50 NO BID $13.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Neutral Green , 1 Gallon EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAJAMSAN: GREEN NEUTRAL DISINFECTANT CLNR ($9.27 per gal) 30 GAL DRUM $278.20
EXJCLEAN AIR: THEOCHEM RINSE NO MORE NEUTRAL FLOOR CLNR, 1 Gallon EACH EACH $12.45
Sow|]Orange Shur Kleen w/Degreaser and Deodorizer EACH EACH $9.05 NO BID $14.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Shine-O-Clean Window Cleaner, Concentrated EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR & ALLIED SUPPLY: 1 GALLON EACH EACH $13.90
EXJAMSAN: KLEAR-VULL CONC. GLASS 12 QTS/CS ( 2.80 QT = $11.20 PER GALLON) GAL GAL $11.20
SOW|Terg Laundry Detergent, 55 Gallon EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $595.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HAND SOAPS/SANITIZERS/DISPENSERS
SOWJAmber Antibacterial Hand Soap, 1 Gallon = $8.25 CASE 4/Cs $33.00 $38.00 $45.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: 1GAL SOFTSOAP LIQUID ANTIBACTERIAL MOISTURIZING SOAP CASE 4/Cs $52.00
SOW,| CASE 4/Cs $78.45 NO BID $86.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]GOJO Hand Soap CASE 12/CS NO BID NO BID $55.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.00
SOWJGOJO Power Gold Hand Cleaner CASE 4/CS $84.88 NO BID $97.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS NO BID NO BID $53.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]lIvory Liquid Soap, 8.6 oz. CASE 25/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: IVORY LIQUID DISH DETERGENT. 24 0Z (240 OZ = .16395 PER 0Z) CASE 10/CS $39.35
EXJCLEAN AIR: IVORY LIQUID SOAP, 12.6 OUNCE (315 OZ =.15714 PER OZ) CASE 25/CS $49.50
SOW]Lotion Hand Soap CASE 12/CS NO BID $17.28 $55.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.00
CASE 24/CS NO BID $49.44 $49.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: GOJ9646-24 CLEAR/CITRUS 24/4.20Z (100.8 OZ = .5059 PER 0Z) CASE 24/CS $51.00
SOWIPureII Instant Hand Sanitizer CASE 12/CS NO BID $49.20 $82.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.00




CLEAN

PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTiION uom SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES
EXJAMSAN: GOJ3659 12/1207. CASE 12/CS $65.33
SOW]Hand Sanitizer, Foaming, Non-Alcohol, 1250ml Theochem (CLEAN AIR=12.93 EACH) CASE 3/Cs $39.80 NO BID $38.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX CASE 6/CTN
SOW|]Dispenser, Purell Hand Sanitizer (AWARDED = TWO VENDORS) EACH EACH $9.75 NO BID NO CHARGE NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Dispenser, Soap, Stainless Steel EACH EACH $32.75 NO BID $59.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Dispenser, Theochem Hand Sanitizer (AWARD = TWO VENDORS) EACH EACH $7.80 NO BID NO CHARGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: BETCO CLARIO WHT FOAMING DISPENSER (BLACK OR WHITE) EACH EACH
KITCHEN SUPPLIES
SOW|]Bakers Spatula, 132" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Bakers Spatula, 167" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 2.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Beard Nets (1k/CASE) CASE 1K/CS NO BID NO BID 38.65 26.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]China Cap Strainer EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: 12" DIA., COURSE MESH 22.95
SOW]Cups, 24 oz. Styrofoam CASE 500/CS NO BID NO BID 39.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 500/CS
SOW]Cups, 4.5 oz. Cone CASE 5K/CS 54.20 NO BID 45.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: GENPAK 4.5 OUNCE ROLLED RIM PAPER CONE WATER CUP CASE 5K/CS 48.00
SOW]Cups, 8 oz. Styrofoam CASE 1K/CS 23.85 NO BID 26.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX CASE 1K/CS
SOW|]Disher #8, NSF, Color Coded, Gray Handle EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, Stainless, Size 16, Coded Handle, Blue EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, Stainless, Size 16, Coded Handle, Ivory EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, White, Size 6 EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, Grey, Size 8 EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, Stainless, Size 8, Coded Handle, Gray EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, 8 oz., Blue Poly Handle EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, 10 oz., Green Poly Handle EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, Stainless, Size 30, Coded Handle, Black EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Disher, Zeroll, Size 30, Black EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Dishwasher Strip, TempRite PACK 25/PK NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJFlat Beater, Aluminum, 60 qt. EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 119.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Flex Tumbler, 12 oz. (CLEAN AIR = 1.33125 EACH) CASE 24/CS NO BID 94.80 31.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EX|BOB BARKER: SOLD 48 PER CASE, $189.60 PER CASE (3.95) CASE 48/CS 189.60
EXJCOOKS: PACKED 48 EACH PER CASE - PRICE SHOWN REFLECTS 48 EA NOT 24(3.3125 EACH) CASE 48/CS 159.00
SOW|]Grocery Bags, Brown, Paper, 4 Ib. BALE 500/BALE NO BID NO BID 11.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Grocery Bags, Brown, Paper, 20 lb. BALE 500/BALE NO BID NO BID 22.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Grocery Bags, Brown, Paper, 57 Ib. BALE 500/BALE NO BID NO BID 36.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Gorilla tray (equivalent to 10355B), Brick Red CASE 10/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID 125.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Handshield-2 Cut Resistant Gloves, Large EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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CLEAN

PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTiION uom SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES
EXJCOOKS: HANDSHIELD 1 EACH EACH 12.90
SOW]Handshield-2 Cut Resistant Gloves, X-Large EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: HANDSHIELD 1 EACH EACH 12.90
SOW]Knife, 10", Round Tip EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Knife, 10" Slicer EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 18.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Kraft Wax Paper Receptacle Liners CASE 500/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]36" Light Duty Kettle Paddle EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 32.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Lock-Tight Lid, 18" x 26", Clear CASE 6/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: PRICE IS PER CASE CASE 6/CS 95.00
SOW]Measuring Cup Set w/Stainless Steel Cups EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Mixer Bowl, Stainless, 60 qt. EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: FITS HOBART CLASSIC SERIES EACH EACH 319.00
SOW(]Paper Towels, 2-Ply, 100 sheets/roll CASE 30/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: 30 ROLLS, 80 SHEETS (2400 SHTS = .0086166 PER SHT) CASE 30/CS 20.68
CLEAN AIR: 12/250SHT (3000 SHTS = .0095 PER SHT) CASE 12/CS 28.50
CASE 30/CASE
SOW]Paper Towels, Multifold CASE CASE NO BID NO BID 25.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAJRENO6116-WB RENOWN GREEN SEAL 20 PER CASE, 250 SHTS PER PACK(5K/CS) CASE CASE 19.45
EXJXPEDX: STEFCO 250SHT NAT HEAVENLY SOFT MULTIFOLD TOWEL (4K/CS) CASE CASE 23.50
SOW|]Plate, Shredder, 3/16" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Plate, 3/8", 10mm, Fine Slicer EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Plate, 7/32", 6mm, Fine Slicer EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Plates, 6" Styrofoam CASE 1K/CS NO BID NO BID 29.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: DART 6" WHT CONCORDE UNLAMINATED FOAM PLATE CASE 1K/CS 23.00
SOWJRound Storage Container, 18 qgt. EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJ]Round Storage Container, 12 qgt. EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Sandwich Spreader, 3%", White, Polypropylene Handle EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Scoop, 84 oz., Aluminum EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|]Storage Container, Clear, 22 gallon (3/CASE) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: PRICE PER EACH EACH EACH 59.66
SOW]Spoodle, Solid, 6 oz., Black EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Spoodle, Solid, 4 oz., Green EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Spoodle, Perforated, 4 oz., Green EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Spoodle, Perforated, 6 oz., Black EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Squeegee, Bench, Red EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 12.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW[Tray Il, Hot food, Insulated, One Piece, Self-Stacking Case 8/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: SUB COOKS GORILLA TRAY #630-120(10 PER CASE) INSULATED SELF STACKING CASE 10/CS 125.50
SOW]Thermometer, 1.75" Dial, 0-220F w/CASE EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

70F12

MELISSAJUMP:ITB:11004JSAWARD:11004SOW BID PRICES-JAIL SUPPLIES (version 1).xls




CLEAN
PACK/UOM OR BOB AIR&ALLIED ROBINSON
TYPE ITEM DESCRIPTiION uom SIZE AM SAN BARKER SUPPLY COOK'S ICS TEXTILES
EXJCOOKS: 1" DIAL EACH EACH 2.49
SOW|]Tumbler, Unbreakable, Polycarbonate, 160z., Amber CASE 48/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: PACKED 24 EACH PER CASE-PRICE BASED ON 24 EACH PER CASE CASE 24/CS 41.95
SOW|]Turner, Square, 6" x 3" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]JWhip, Stainless, 60 gt., Aluminum Base EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCOOKS: FIT HOBART CLASSIC SERIES MIXERS EACH EACH 185.00
SOW]Whip, French, 18" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 4.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Whip, French, 20" EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Ultimate Dishwasher Apron EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAUNDRY DETERGENTS
SOW]Flo-Glo Chlorine (7.5796 PER GALLON) DRUM 55/GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $416.88
EXJAMSAN: SPART CLF CHLORINE BLEACH (5.79854) DRUM 55/GAL $318.92
SOW]Flo-New Fabric Softener (16.41 PER GALLON) DRUM 15/GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $246.20
EXJAMSAN: SPARTAN CLF LAUNDRY SOUR (7.0721 PER GALLON) DRUM 55/GAL $388.97
SOW]Flo-Plus Water Base Detergent (16.579 PER GALLON) DRUM 55/GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $911.85
EXJAMSAN: SPARTAN CLF LAUNDRY DETERGENT (11.4885 PER GALLON) DRUM 55/GAL $631.87
SOW]Super Flo-Kon Laundry Detergent (15.4683 PER GALLON) DRUM 55/GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $850.76
EXJAMSAN: SPARTAN CFL LAUNDRY BREAK (7.7358 PER GALLON) DRUM 55/GAL $425.47
METERED AEROSOL DEODORIZERS/DISPENSERS
SOW]Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Cinnamon EACH EACH $6.90 NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW][Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Exotic Garden EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS
Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Green Apple EACH EACH $3.80 NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS
Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Mulberry EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS
Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Neutralizer EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS
Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Pifia Colada EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS
Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Strawberry EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CASE 12/CS
SOW]Metered Aerosol Deodorizers - Vanilla EACH EACH $4.80 NO BID $5.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Dispenser, Metered Aerosol EACH EACH $26.55 NO BID $29.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: HOSPECO STRATUS IIl METERED AEROSOL DISPENSER EACH EACH $32.00
MISCELLANEOUS PARTS/ITEMS
SOwW
Caster, Std, Swivel w/Insert, 2" Dia., Soft Rubber, 75 Ib. Per Wheel EACH EACH $7.95 NO BID $9.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJCombat Quick Kill Roach Bait (12Pk - 12/Cs) 144 PER CASE CASE 12/CS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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EXJAMSAN: COMBAT ANT & ROACH KILLING SYSTEM 6/PK (.85 PER = 6 PER PACK) PKG 6/PKG $5.10
EXJCLEAN AIR: COMBAT QUICK KILL ROACH BAIT - GEL (.50 PER = 144 PER CASE) CASE 12/CS $72.00
SOW]Cooler, Orange w/Lid, 10 gallon EAHC EACH $72.00 $62.00 $69.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]OFF Deep Woods Bug Spray CASE 12/CS NO BID $62.95 $76.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: AMRA00482 60Z INSECT Il W/DEET 23.75% CASE 12/CS $99.05
SOW]Dispenser, Dermapro EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO CHARGE NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00
EXJAMSAN: 9034 EACH EACH $12.60
SOW]Dispenser, Multifold Paper Towel EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: BOB262, STAINLESS STEEL (AWARD IF STAINLESS REQUESTED) EACH EACH $40.40
EXJCLEAN AIR: DISPENSER, MULTIFOLD PAPER TOWEL B26S STAINLESS EACH EACH $61.15
EX EACH EACH _
SOW]Fogger, Deep REACH (3/Cs) CASE 3/CS NO BID NO BID $12.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: IBI 99-2111 60Z INDOOR FOGGER CASE 3/CS $7.15
SOW]Grafitti Remover Wipes EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJCLEAN AIR: GRAFITTI REMOVER WIPES 30/COUNT 30 COUNT 30 COUNT $10.45
SOW]Paper Picker EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $14.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: UNG PPPPO 42" LIGHT ALUM TUB EACH EACH $11.85
SOW]Paper Picker, Replacement Pin EACH EACH $4.50 NO BID $7.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]11" Type-2 Crevice Tool - Gray EACH EACH $5.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJ]1%" x 14" Type-1 Nylon Brush - Gray EACH EACH $26.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]1%" x 3" Type-2 Dust Poly Brush - Gray EACH EACH $6.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOWJ1%" x 54" Aluminum Wand w/ABS Tool EACH EACH $36.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIGNS
SOW]Sign, "Caution Wet Floor" EACH EACH NO BID $8.22 $16.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJAMSAN: RENO5114 WET FLOOR SIGN EACH EACH $10.40
EXJXPEDX: CARLISLE 25" X 11" YEL MULTI LINGUAL WET FLOOR SIGN EACH EACH $12.00
SoOw]Sign, Mesh 48" x 48", (Sheriff's Work Detail) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $119.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sowl]Sign, Galvanized tri-pod for mesh sign EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $80.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
TEXTILES
SOW]Towel, White, 22"x44", 100% Cotton Terry (17.00 PER DZ) BALE 25DZ/BALE NO BID 355.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 425.00 NO BID
EX]BOB BARKER: SOLD BY DOZEN, $14.20 PER DOZEN DOZEN 12 EACH 14.20
EXJICS: TOWEL WHITE 22" X 44" 100% COTTON TERRY 6# L0162 DOZEN DOZEN 16.90
SOW]Washcloth, White, 12"x12", 100% Cotton Terry (2.90 DZ) BALE 200DZ/BALE NO BID 480.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 580.00 NO BID
EX|BOB BARKER: SOLD BY DOZEN, $2.40 DOZEN 12 EACH 2.40
EXJICS: WASHCLOTH WHITE 12"X12" 100% COTTON TERRY .75# DOZEN DOZEN 2.11
PROTECTIVE APPAREL
SOWJ[Coveralls, Hood & Boots - Large CASE 25/CS NO BID NO BID $61.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW][Coveralls, Hood & Boots - Xlarge CASE 25/CS NO BID NO BID $61.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - Small CASE 1K/CS $53.25 $64.50 $68.90 NO BID $60.00 NO BID NO BID
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EXJXPEDX: TRADEX SMALL LATEX POWDER FREE NON MEDICAL MULTI PURPOSE CASE 1K/CS $62.00
SOW]Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - Medium CASE 1K/CS $53.25 $64.50 $68.90 NO BID $60.00 NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX MEDIUM LATEX POWDER FREE NON MEDICAL MULTI PURPOSE CASE 1K/CS $62.00
SOW|Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - Large CASE 1K/CS $53.25 $64.50 $68.90 NO BID $60.00 NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX LARGE LATEX POWDER FREE NON MEDICAL MULTI PURPOSE CASE 1K/CS $62.00
SOW]Gloves, Latex, Powder Free - XLarge CASE 1K/CS $53.25 $64.50 $68.90 NO BID $60.00 NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX XLARGE LATEX POWDER FREE NON MEDICAL MULTI PURPOSE CASE 1K/CS $62.00
Sowl]Gloves, Leather Work CASE 12/CS $23.40 NO BID $24.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free - Small CASE 1K/CS $33.50 NO BID $38.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX SMALL SYNTHETIC VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES CASE 1K/CS $36.00
EXJICS: NITRILE/VINYL COMBO CASE 1K/CS $52.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free - Medium CASE 1K/CS $33.50 NO BID $38.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX MEDIUM SYNTHETIC VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES CASE 1K/CS $36.00
EXJICS: NITRILE/VINYL COMBO $52.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free - Large CASE 1K/CS $33.50 NO BID $38.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX LARGE SYNTHETIC VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES CASE 1K/CS $36.00
EXJICS: NITRILE/VINYL COMBO $52.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free - XLarge CASE 1K/CS $33.50 NO BID $38.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX XLARGE SYNTHETIC VINYL POWDER FREE GLOVES CASE 1K/CS $36.00
EXJICS: NITRILE/VINYL COMBO $52.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Healthy Hand - Small CASE 1K/CS NO BID NO BID $41.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX SMALL SYNTHETIC POWDERFREE EXAM GLOVE CASE 1K/CS $42.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Healthy Hand - Medium CASE 1K/CS NO BID NO BID $41.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX MEDIUM SYNTHETIC POWDERFREE EXAM GLOVE CASE 1K/CS $42.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Healthy Hand - Large CASE 1K/CS NO BID NO BID $41.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX LARGE SYNTHETIC POWDERFREE EXAM GLOVE CASE 1K/CS $42.00
SOW]Gloves, Vinyl, Powder Free, Healthy Hand - Xlarge CASE 1K/CS NO BID NO BID $41.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
EXJXPEDX: TRADEX XLARGE SYNTHETIC POWDERFREE EXAM GLOVE CASE 1K/CS $42.00
SOwW]Mask, 3M N95 Health Care Particulate Respirator & Surgical BOX 20/BOX $18.75 NO BID $19.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW]Mask, CPR/Microshield w/Face Shield EACH EACH NO BID NO BID $11.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sow|Safety Glasses EACH EACH $1.15 NO BID $1.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SPONGES/PADS
SOW]Scour Pad, 3M, No. 74 CASE CASE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $41.00
EXJCLEAN AIR: SCOUR PAD, 3M, NO. 74, CASE 20/CS 20/CS CASE $43.75
EXJCLEAN AIR: HYDRO SPONGE NO.74, CASE 20/CS 20/CS CASE $26.00
EXJAMSAN: 20/CS 20/CS CASE $49.05
SOW]Scour Pad, 3M, No. 96 CASE CASE $39.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.50
EXJAMSAN: RENOWN REN02114 CASE 20/CS $8.60
EXJCLEAN AIR: SCOUR PAD, 3M, NO.96, 3/20 CASE 3/20 $39.00
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EX|CLEAN AIR: SCOUR PAD, ROYAL CASE 3/20 $21.65
Ssow|Sponge, Green, 9" x 4 1/2" x 2" NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sow]Sponge, Yellow, 9" x4 1/2" x 2" NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sow|Sponge, Green, 9" x4 1/2" x 2" NO BID NO BID $2.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
sow]Sponge, Yellow, 9" x4 1/2" x 2" NO BID NO BID $2.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Ssow|Sponge, Blue NO BID NO BID $2.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TRASH CANS/LINERS

SOW|Trash Can Lid, Rubbermaid (32 gallon) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJCLEAN AIR: RCP 2631 GRAY EACH EACH $11.95

EXJAMSAN: 32 GAL LID ONLY EACH EACH $9.75

EACH EACH _
SOW|Trash Can Lid, Rubbermaid (44 gallon) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CLEAN AIR: RCP 2645 44 GAL EACH EACH $18.45

EXJAMSAN: 44 GALLON LID ONLY EACH EACH $10.95

eXJXPEDX: TRASH CAN LID, RUBBERMAID FOR 44 GALLON CONTAINER GRAY EACH EACH $16.00
SOW|Trash Can, Rubbermaid (32 gallon) EACH EACH $29.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAN: APPEALAPP15504 32 GAL EACH EACH $23.88

EXJCLEAN AIR: RCP2632 GRAY - 32 GALLON EACH EACH $26.96

EXJXPEDX: TRASH CAN, RUBBERMAID 32 GALLON GRAY EAC EACH $32.00
SOW|Trash Can, Rubbermaid (44 GALLON) EACH EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJCLEAN AIR: RCP2643 GRAY - 44 GALLON EACH EACH $49.95
SOW|Trash Liners, 24" x 33", Clear, 8 Micron (.0729 PER BAG) CASE 500/CS NO BID NO BID $36.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAN: 1000 CS (.02795 PER BAG) CASE 1000/CS $27.95

EXJXPEDX: HIMOLENE LINERS 24X33 8 MIC CLEAR ROLLS 1K/CTN (.0665 PER BAG) CASE 1K/CS $33.25
SOW|Trash Liners, 33" x 40", Clear, 11 Micron (AMSAN: .072 PB; CLEAN AIR: .0714 PB) CASE 500/CS $36.00 NO BID $35.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EX CASE 500/CS
SOW|Trash Liners, 38" x 58", Black, 2 Mil (.0834 PER BAG) CASE 500/CS NO BID NO BID $41.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAN: 38" X 60" BLACK (.33 PER BAG) CASE 100/CS $33.00

EXIXPEDX: HERITAGE 38X52 2 MIL BLACK LINER 100/CTN (.4325 PER BAG) CASE 100/CS $43.25
SOW|Trash Liners, 38" x 60", Clear (.05262 PER BAG) CASE 500/CS NO BID NO BID $26.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AMSAN: 38 X 60" CLEAR 2 MIL (.49 PER BAG) CASE 100/CS $49.00

EXJXPEDX: HIMOLENE LINERS 38X60 14 MIC CLEAR 200/CTN (.149 PER BAG) CASE 200/CS $29.80
SOW|Trash Liners, 38" x 60", Clear, 17 Micron (.05262 PER BAG) CASE 500/CS NO BID NO BID $26.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EXJAMSAN: (.20 PER BAG) CASE 200/CS $40.00

EXJXPEDX: HIMOLENE LINERS 38X60 CLEAR 17 MIC 200/CTN (.18075 PER BAG) CASE 200/CS $36.15

ZIP TIES

SOW|Zip-Ties, 8" BAG 100/BAG NO BID NO BID $9.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Zip-Ties, 11" BAG 100/BAG NO BID NO BID $17.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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SOW|Zip-Ties, 14" BAG 100/BAG NO BID NO BID $27.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SOW|Zip-Ties, 18" BAG 100/BAG NO BID NO BID $29.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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