COLLIER COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE (CCSO)

AWARD

REQUEST FOR QUOTE
June 3rd, 2020
#2020-001
Mercury Mercury Mercury Mercury Removal Awarded
Vendor 400XL Verado 400XL Verado 350XL Verado 350XL Verado & Shippng Extended Cost | Accessories Total Cost W
14000015A 14000016A 1350v231D 1350v231D Installation -
All Marine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Amzim Marine $23,497.00 $23,497.00 $20,970.00 $20,970.00 $8,000.00 $3,600.00 $100,534.00 $25,856.54 | $126,390.54
Gulf Shores Marina No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
MarineMax Naples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Mercury Marine No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Naples Boat Mart No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Naples Marina Sales Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Sara Bay Marina No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
The Boat House No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Walkers Hideaway of Naples No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid N/A
Wolcott Marine $22,290.00 $22,618.00 $19,955.00 $19,955.00 $13,846.10 $0.00 $98,664.10 $0.00 $98,644.10 X

Outboard Boat Motor Delivery Deadline

Awarded vendor guarantees each outboard boat motor bid on will be installed and the completed boat, along with the old motors will be delivered to the Collier County Sheriff's Office (CCSO) no later than

Monday, August 31st, 2020

Shipment Details

All shipments shall be F.O.B. Destination to the address below:

Collier County Sheriff's Office
Procurement Bureau
2885 County Barn Rd.

Naples, FL 34112

Contact Information

Procurement
Mika Taylor, Buyer
Email: Procurement@colliersheriff.org
Phone: 239-252-9040

Payment Terms

A Purchase Order (PO) shall be issued and it will be considered a single contract.




